
July 30, 2021

Manager of Human Resources, 

posAbilities Association of BC

Suite 240-4664 Lougheed Hwy

Burnaby, BC, V5C 5T5


Dear Sir or Madam, 


I am contacting you to express my strong interest in working as a junior behaviour 
consultant with your association. I am currently employed at Bridge kids Behaviour 
Consulting as well as at JOYBCI, where I work with individuals with ASD. I believe that my 
passion for working with children, along with the extensive experience and education I 
have gained in special education, autism and developmental disabilities would make me an 
ideal candidate for the position.


I have been working in special education for over ten years as a teacher and behaviour/
senior behaviour interventionist. I have worked with diverse groups and individuals, 
children and adolescents with ASD, improving behaviours and social skills, cultivating play 
skills, communicating with family members, and providing support and empathy across 
multiple aspects of young autistic patients' lives. In my work I often designed and 
implemented emerging evidence-based music interventions to improve my clients’ 
emotional well-being, self-expression, confidence, and overall quality of life.


I have recently completed my Master of Education in Special Education from the University 
of British Columbia, with a concentration in Autism and Developmental Disabilities. In this 
program I have learned how to conduct functional assessments and design positive 
behaviour support plans, and I have acquired the specialized expertise to work with 
families and treatment teams. Through my extensive education in the field, I have gained 
foundational knowledge using evidence-based practices for supporting the learning needs 
of diverse learners experiencing problem behaviour at home, school, and in community 
settings, as well as supporting staff professional development opportunities.


I deeply care about the people I work with. I am always willing to learn new things and take 
on new challenges, and I believe my experience, education and enthusiasm for this field 
will be an asset to your organization.


I would welcome the opportunity to meet with you and discuss the possibility of joining 
your team. 


I am attaching my resume, which shows additional details regarding my expertise and 
career achievements. 


Thank you for your time and consideration,


Noa Hass 


